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Sir: Portal vein stenosis, with the ac- 
companying technical difficulties, 
may occur after liver transplantation 
and is usually detected either in the 
early postoperative period, or later 
on in association with inflammatory 
reactions in the hepatic hilum. It is a 
subject seldom referred to in the lit- 
erature [ l ,  61 but one that can lead to 
significant disturbances in hepatic 
function, particularly when the ste- 
nosis is severe. 

A 29-year-old man with cirrhosis 
secondary to hepatitis C virus 
(Child B), developed a biliary leak in 
the immediate postoperative period. 
The leak originated from a chole- 
dochocholedochostomy that had 
been repaired on the 18th post- 
operative day. The repair converted 
the anastomosis to a Roux-en-Y he- 
paticojejunostomy. Three days later, 
after the accidental extraction of the 
biliary stent, a new leak was ob- 
served and a reanastomosis was per- 
formed with a new stent. The patient 
was discharged from the hospital on 
the 39th postoperative day with good 
hepatic function. 

One year later, a stenosis of the 
hepaticojejunostomy with hepato- 
lithiasis wav diagnosed. A stone was 
removed fr m the hepatic duct and a 
new anasto % , osis was performed. 
During a routine analysis 30 months 
after liver transplantation, a moder- 

ate alteration in the coagulation va- 
lues was detected (prothrombin ac- 
tivity 60 %), while the other hepatic 
parameters remained near-normal 
(AST 35 U, ALT 36 U, bilirubin 
1.6 mg/dl, alkaline phosphatase 405 
IU, GGT 120 IU). At the same time, 
endoscopy showed esophageal vari- 
ces. Hepatic arteriography was per- 
formed and demonstrated a severe 
and rather long (3-cm) portal vein 
stenosis with major collateral circu- 
lation through the coronary vein 
(Fig. 1 A), something that has not 
been reported in earlier studies. 

Transparietohepatic measure- 
ment of the preanastomotic portal 
vein pressure showed a value of 
35 mmHg. Therefore, a series of 
progressive dilatations with angio- 
plasty balloons, ranging in diameter 
from 10 to 14 mm, was carried out. 
The dilatation obtained was limited 
(20 % of the portal diameter), and 
although the pressure decreased to 

9 mm Hg, most of the collateral cir- 
culation through the coronary vein 
persisted (Fig. 1 B). Given these cir- 
cumstances, we decided to perform 
a new angioplasty and to place 
a 12-mm “Wall stent” prosthesis 
(Schneider, Zurich), which enabled 
us to obtain an almost complete di- 
latation of the stenosis with dis- 
appearance of the collateral circula- 
tion through the coronary vein 
(Fig. 1 C,D). At the end of the pro- 
cedure, the intrahepatic path was 
embolized with coils and gel foam. 
Measurement of portal pressure im- 
mediately after the procedure failed 
to show any decrease. In the 2 weeks 
that followed, the patient had fever 
that was successfully treated with 

Fig. 1A-D Portography: A transhepatic, 
demonstrating a severe stenosis of the por- 
talvein; B after dilatation with a 14-mm 
balloon; C, D after placement of a “Wall 
stent” prosthesis 
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antibiotics. Hepatic function became 
normal and the esophageal varices 
disappeared. 

Now, 1 year after the angioplasty, 
the patient has normal hepatic va- 
lues. The Doppler ultrasound results 
are normal and endoscopy shows no 
varices. Portal vascularization, which 
has been studied by arterial porto- 
graphy, shows an increase in the dia- 
meter of the stenotic portion com- 
pared to its size immediately after 
placement of the prosthesis. 

was detected in a patient 30 months 
after liver transplantation, some- 
thing not previously reported. The 
characteristics and timing of this 
complication suggest that it may be 
related to the inflammatory pro- 
cesses and operations that were in- 
volved in repairing the bile leaks. 
Clinically, the complication was de- 
monstrated by alterations in the coa- 
gulation data, slight changes in he- 
patic tests, and the appearance of 
esophageal varices resulting from 
portal hypertension. 

The portal thrombosis rate is low 
in large series, ranging from 1 % to 
2.6 % [2-51. However, this is seldom 
referred to in the literature [l, 61. The 
series reported by Azoulay et al. is 
the most important of these series 
[l]. They also describe an original 
treatment with a minimally invasive 
angi oplasty technique. 

In the present case, portal stenosis 

In our case, angioplasty was 
clearly insufficient, and for that rea- 
son we decided to place a “Wall 
stent” prosthesis. With this tech- 
nique an almost complete resolution 
of the portal stenosis was achieved, 
with the disappearance of the col- 
lateral circulation and esophageal 
varices. This is the first case of portal 
stenosis after liver transplantation 
that was successfully treated with 
this kind of vascular prosthesis. 

With regard to the route used for 
the angioplasty, percutaneous trans- 
hepatic puncture can, in theory, lead 
to more complications than mesen- 
teric access, as described by Azoulay 
et al. [l]. An advantage, however, is 
that general anesthesia can be 
avoided and the patient can be trea- 
ted in the interventional radiology 
unit. Nonetheless, transhepatic ac- 
cess has frequently been used in our 
patients without major complica- 
tions since the intrahepatic path is 
embolized at the end of the proce- 
dure. 

We conclude that the use of “Wall 
stent” vascular prostheses should be 
considered in cases such as the one 
described here when angioplasty 
does not suffice and always as an al- 
ternative to reconstructive surgery. 
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